
First Name: _______________________ ​ Last Name: _________________________________​Emergency Contact: _______________________________ 
 
City: ________________________________​ State: ______     Shirt: _______________________​ Emergency Contact Phone:_______________________ 
 
Phone: _____________________________​Age: ________    Gender: ________​ Email: _________________________________________________________ 

SELECT RACE CHOICE BELOW 
 

(     ) 10K Run* ………………………………………………..……….. $25 Nation Resident / $35 General Public 
 
(     ) 2.5M Run/Walk* …......................................................................….. $20 Nation Resident / $30 General Public 
 
(     ) 2.5M Run/Walk Tuscarora Student (18 and under)* …..….. $10 Nation Resident (18 and under) 
 
Make Checks Payable To: Tuscarora Nation and mail to 1570 Braley Road Youngstown, NY 14174 
 
*Register by July 1, 2025 for a guaranteed shirt in your requested size. A small quantity of extra shirts will be ordered 
and distributed on a first-come, first-serve basis until they are gone. 
Tuscarora 10K & 2.5M Application & Liability Waiver 
 
EVENT REGISTRATION AGREEMENT AND LIABILITY WAIVER (the Agreement and Waiver) 
 
You must read and agree to the following Agreement and Waiver in order to use itsyourrace.com and to register and participate in the event 
entitled Tuscarora Nation 10K Run & 2.5M Run/Walk. 
  
Waiver. You know and understand that indoor or outdoor exercising, racing, and other athletic activities can be potentially hazardous. You 
attest that you are medically able and properly trained for the Tuscarora Nation 10K Run & 2.5M Run/Walk and agree that you have been 
medically cleared by a qualified physician to participate and safely complete the event. You understand that the event may be held over 
public roads, water ways, off-road locations, private or public parks, private or public property, or in facilities or locations open to the public 
or subject to other hazards including, but not limited to, tornados, lightning, high winds, animals, or other dangers during the event and upon 
which hazards are to be expected. Participation carries certain inherent risks that cannot be eliminated completely. You assume all risks 
associated with participating in this event, including but not limited to: falls, contact with other participants, contact with other people who 
carry contagious diseases, broken bones, effects of the weather, traffic, terrorist acts, criminal activities, the condition of the course, viruses 
in the air, gastrointestinal discomfort and other physical discomfort, dehydration, illness or even death. All such risks are known and 
appreciated by you. You also agree to abide by any decisions of any race official or medical staff, should one be present at the event, relative 
to your ability to safely complete the event. Having read and understood this waiver and in consideration of accepting your entry, you and 
anyone entitled to act on your behalf, waive and release, IYR, ITS, Race Management Solutions Inc., Tuscarora Nation, race organizers, race 
vendors, race promoters, race benefactors, volunteers, sponsors, their officers, employees, agents, representatives and successors from all 
claims or liabilities of any kind resulting from your participation in this event even though that liability may arise out of negligence or 
carelessness on the part of the persons named in this waiver. You grant permission to all foregoing to use any photographs, motion pictures, 
recordings, or any other record of this event for legitimate purposes. You hereby waive any right to inspect or approve the finished electronic, 
photograph, or printed matter that may be used in conjunction with them now or in the future. You will abide by these guidelines.   
 
 
 
Participant Signature: ________________________________________________________​ ​ Date: ____________________________________ 
 
 
Parent Signature: _____________________________________________________________​ ​ Date: ____________________________________ 
​ ​ (Required if participant is under 18 years old) 


